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TOTAL FISH PRODUCTION AND ITS VALUE (TONNES 
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NUMBER OF FISHERMEN ENGAGED IN RESERVOIRS 
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FISH PRODUCTION FROM RESERVOIRS 2016-17 (IN TONNES) 
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SEED STOCKING IN RESERVOIRS (IN LAKHS) 
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FISH SPECIES OF RESERVOIRS 

1. CATLA (Catla catla) 

2. ROHU (Labeo rohita) 

3. SINGHARA (Mystus seenghala) 

4. MRIGAL (Cirrhina  mrigala) 

5. KALBAUS (Labeo calbasu) 

6. GRASS CARP (Ctenopharyngodon idellus) 

7. MIRROR CARP ( Cyprinus carpio ) 

8. MAHSHEER (Tor putitora) 

9. GID / BATA (Labeo dero) 

10. SILVER CARP (Hypophthalmicthys molitrix)  

11. MALLI (Wallago attu) 

12. CHANNA Spp. 
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CARP FISH SEED PRODUCTION (IN LAKHS) 

DEOLI 
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47.68 

NALAGARH 
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TOTAL REVENUE (IN LAKHS) 

TARGET  

292.22  LAKH 

ACHIEVED 414.70 LAKH 



OTHER ACHIEVEMENTS 

1 

•A special grant of 2.00 crores of which 1.00 crore has been 
released by the government of India, for construction of first 
ever mahseer farm of the country in Mandi district. Construction 
work has been started during 2006 and is near in its completion 
phase . 

2 

•A 100% Centrally Sponsored Scheme on "Strengthening of data 
base of Information Networking for the fisheries sector" was 
initiated and sample survey is being implemented in four 
districts viz. Chamba, Una, Sirmour and Hamirpur. catch survey 
is being done.. 

3 

•Premium free insurance cover of Rs. 100000 each has been 
provided to all the 11,100 working fishermen of the State during 
the year 2015-16. 

4 

•A new dimension has been given to the fisheries promotional 
programmes of the State by creating targeted employment under 
the various fisheries schemes. During the last year 597 new 
employment avenues were generated under the major welfare 
schemes viz. pond construction. 

5 

•Pond fish farming have been identified as thrust area for 
fisheries development. In order to expand aquaculture, subsidy 
has been increased @80% the unit cost. New schemes were added 
under this programme viz. establishment of seed hatchery, fish 
feed unit, and provision has been made to provide fish seed at 
the door of fish farmers. 


